BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit

Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

1) 3,000

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 1"
capacity, round ring,
color: Blue, size: 8-1/2" x
11", Wilson-Jones #368-
14NBL or equal.

61566704

0.92 for24
1.21 forl2

2760.00
3630.00

0.00 No Bid

0.97

2910.00

0.00 No Bid

Samsill
Wilson

11302
Jones

368-14NBL

Samsill

11302

2| 1,200

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 1-
1/2" capacity, round ring,
color: Blue, size: 8-1/2"
x 11", Wilson-Jones #368-
34NBL or equal.

61566698

1.52

1824.00

0.00 No Bid

1.59

1908.00

0.00 No Bid

Samsill
Wilson
24 pk

11502
Jones

368-34NBL

Samsill

11502

3 600

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 2"
capacity, round ring,
color: Black, sz: 8-1/2" x
11", Wilson-Jones #368-
44NB or equal.

61566699

1.74

1044.00

0.00 No Bid

1.82

1092.00

0.00 No Bid

Samsill

Wilson Jones

24 pk.

11600

W368-44NB

Samsill

11600

4 360

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 3"
capacity, round ring,
color: Blue, size: 8-1/2" x
11", Wilson-Jones #368-
49NBL or equal.

61566706

2.83

1018.80

0.00 No Bid

3.15

1134.00

0.00 No Bid

Wilson Jones

368-49NBL

Samsill

11802

5/ 3,000

each

Binder, Vinyl, View - 3-
ring, 1-1/2" capacity,
round ring, color:White,
size: 8-1/2" x 11", Wilson-
Jones #362-34W or equal.

61566696

1.53

4590.00

0.00 No Bid

1.60

4800.00

0.00 No Bid

Wilson Jones

24 pk.

362-34W

Samsill

18557C

6/ 1,800

each

Binder, Vinyl, View - 3-
ring, 2" capacity, round
ring, color:White, size: 8-
1/2"x11", Wilson-Jones
#362-44\N ar eaual

61566697

1.74

3132.00

0.00 No Bid

1.82

3276.00

0.00 No Bid

Samsill

24 pk. |18567C

Samsill

18567C
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School S

pecialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

1) 3,000

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 1"
capacity, round ring,
color: Blue, size: 8-1/2" x
11", Wilson-Jones #368-
14NBL or equal.

61566704

0.91

2730.00

1.34

4020.00

0.95

2850.00

0.913

2739.00

Samsill

11302

SchoolSmart

86360

Avery

3300

Tops

90312

2| 1,200

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 1-
1/2" capacity, round ring,
color: Blue, size: 8-1/2"
x 11", Wilson-Jones #368-
34NBL or equal.

61566698

1.46

1752.00

1.53

1836.00

1.58

1896.00

1.46

1752.00

Samsill

11502

SchoolSmart

86366

Avery

3400

Tops

90322

3 600

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 2"
capacity, round ring,
color: Black, sz: 8-1/2" x
11", Wilson-Jones #368-
44NB or equal.

61566699

1.58

948.00

1.86

1116.00

1.85

1110.00

1.52

912.00

Samsill

11600

SchoolSmart

86371

Avery

3501

Tops

90330

4 360

each

Binder, Vinyl - 3-ring, 3"
capacity, round ring,
color: Blue, size: 8-1/2" x
11", Wilson-Jones #368-
49NBL or equal.

61566706

2.60

936.00

2.24

806.40

2.95

1062.00

2.60

936.00

Samsill

11802

SchoolSmart

86381

Avery

3601

Tops

90342

5/ 3,000

each

Binder, Vinyl, View - 3-
ring, 1-1/2" capacity,
round ring, color:White,
size: 8-1/2" x 11", Wilson-
Jones #362-34W or equal.

61566696

1.30

3900.00

1.73

5190.00

1.56

4680.00

1.29

3870.00

Samsill

18557C

SchoolSmart

86391

Avery

5726

Tops

90631

6/ 1,800

each

Binder, Vinyl, View - 3-
ring, 2" capacity, round
ring, color:White, size: 8-
1/2"x11", Wilson-Jones
#362-44\N ar eaual

61566697

1.47

2646.00

2.01

3618.00

1.80

3240.00

1.47

2646.00

Samsill

18567C

SchoolSmart

86394

Avery

5731

Tops

90641
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or

Out-of-

State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Binder Clips - 12/pkg.,
black, Officemate OIC or

€q

1,200

pkg.

Medium, 1-1/2” wide,
5/8" cap., #99050

61566072

0.54

648.00

0.28 336.00

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

1,200

pkg.

Mini, 9/16" wide, 1/4"
cap., #99010

0.20

240.00

0.18 216.00

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Office Mate

9050 99010

1294-050
1294-10

Imperial

1,800

btl.

Cleaner, Whiteboard - 8
0z. spray btl., non-toxic,
AP seal, Sanford EXPO
#81803 or equal.

61566084

1.73

3114.00

131 2358.00

1.76

3168.00

1.80 3240.00

Dixon

94008

Imperial 06-131

Dixon

94008

Expo 81803

1,200

each

Clipboard - Letter size,
9”x12-1/2”, hard- board,
Officemate OIC #83140

61566000

0.75

900.00

0.79 948.00

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Leonard

89003

Imperial 1272 LR

10

120

boxes

Correction Fluid -
Multipurpose, bond white,
min. 22ml/.74 oz. bottle,
foam wedge applicator,

12/box, Liquid Paper
#BRANT nr annal

61566605

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

8.40 1008.00

L.P 56401

11

240

each

Correction Pen — All-
purpose formula, 7ml.,
fine needle tip & squeeze
control, Liquid Paper
#56201 or equal

61566586

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

1.20 288.00

Lig. Pap. 56201

12

1,500

each

Correction Tape -
Dispenser style, 1/6" x

394", dry line, Paper Mate
#6604, Bic Wite-Out

61566588

1.08

1620.00

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Bic 10 pk.

WOTAPP11

13

2,400

each

Eraser, Whiteboard -
Soft pile eraser for dry
erase surfaces, 2''x5",
Sanford EXPO #81505 or

61529817

0.00

No Bid

43
1.10

1031.00
2640.00

0.00

No Bid

1.28 3072.00
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School S

pecialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-

State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Binder Clips - 12/pkg.,
black, Officemate OIC or

€q

1,200

pkg.

Medium, 1-1/2” wide,
5/8" cap., #99050

61566072

0.39 468.00

0.41

492.00

0.00

No Bid

0.358

429.60

1,200

pkg.

Mini, 9/16" wide, 1/4"
cap., #99010

0.19 228.00

0.18

216.00

0.00

No Bid

0.139

166.80

1110667
50001

Pyramid
Leonard

SchoolSmart

32400
38221

General

BC50/ BC10

1,800

btl.

Cleaner, Whiteboard - 8
0z. spray btl., non-toxic,
AP seal, Sanford EXPO
#81803 or equal.

61566084

1.49 2682.00

2.09

3762.00

1.70

3060.00

0.94

1692.00

Sanford 81803

Sanford

81803

Sanford

81803

WhB.
Wizard

81803

1,200

each

Clipboard - Letter size,
9”x12-1/2”, hard- board,
Officemate OIC #83140

61566000

0.60 720.00

0.79

948.00

0.00

No Bid

0.597

716.40

Pyramid 1162437

SchoolSmart

1272480

Standard

05612

10

120

boxes

Correction Fluid -
Multipurpose, bond white,
min. 22ml/.74 oz. bottle,
foam wedge applicator,

12/box, Liquid Paper
#BRANT nr annal

61566605

7.92 950.40

11.52

1382.40

7.92

950.40

8.73
4.18

1047.60
501.60

Lig.Pap. 56401

Lig. Pap.

56401

Lig. Pap.

56401

Lig.Pap.
Corrector

564-01
564-01

11

240

each

Correction Pen — All-
purpose formula, 7ml.,
fine needle tip & squeeze
control, Liquid Paper
#56201 or equal

61566586

264.00

1.53

367.20

276.00

1.16
45

278.40
108.00

Lig.Pap. 56201

Lig. Pap.

56201

Lig. Pap.

56201

Lig.Pap.
Corrector

562-01
562-01

12

1,500

each

Correction Tape -
Dispenser style, 1/6" x

394", dry line, Paper Mate
#6604, Bic Wite-Out

61566588

1785.00

1.62

2430.00

1.25

1875.00

45
1.12

675.00
1680.00

Bic WOTAPP

Bic

WPTAPP11

Bic

WOTAPP11

Corrector
Bic

TC983
WOTA-P10

13

2,400

each

Eraser, Whiteboard -
Soft pile eraser for dry
erase surfaces, 2''x5",
Sanford EXPO #81505 or

61529817

1.23
44

2952.00
1056.00

1.69

4056.00

0.00

No Bid

0.28

672.00
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-

TITY | UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

19465
19464

Imperial

Sanford 81505

14

120| each

Finger Moistener — Non-
toxic, odorless, stainless

formula, 1.75 oz., Lee
Sortkwik #10134 or equal

61566014

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

15

Highlighter Marker -
Fluorescent colors, large
size, 12/box, Sanford
Sharpie Accent ONLY.

600| dozen

Fluorescent Yellow,
#25025

62066620

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

3.46

2076.00

3.96 2376.00

360 dozen

Fluorescent Green,
#25026

62066621

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

3.46

1245.60

3.96 1425.60

1 or| dozen

more

Fluorescent Pink, #25009

62066623

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

3.46

3.46

3.96 3.90

Dixon

47065
47068
47066

Sanford 2502x

16

1,200| sets

Highlighter Marker Set
— Large size, 6-color set:
fl.yellow, fl.pink,
fl.orange, fl.green, yellow
& turquoise, Sanford
Sharpie #25076 ONLY

62066628

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

2.06

2472.00

2.25 2700.00

Dixon

47076

Sanford 25076

17

3,400| sets

Index, Ring Binder -
Insertable dividers,

8.5"x11", premium buff
stock, reinforced binding
edge, 5 clear tabs, Wilson-
Jones #W54125 or equal.

61566702

0.42

1428.00

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Wilson Jones
24 set

W54125

18

500| sets

Markers - Fiber tip,
permanent ink, 5-pack/4-
color set: (black/2, blue,

green, red), Sanford
Charnia #2NAE2 nr aniial

62066624

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

3.15 1575.00

Sanford 30653
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School S

pecialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

Sanford
Pyramid

81505
1099241

Sanford

81505

Standard T-104

14

120

each

Finger Moistener — Non-
toxic, odorless, stainless

formula, 1.75 oz., Lee
Sortkwik #10134 or equal

61566014

1.89

226.80

2.21

265.20

0.00

No Bid

212

254.40

Lee

10134

Lee

10134.00

Lee 10134

15

Highlighter Marker -
Fluorescent colors, large
size, 12/box, Sanford
Sharpie Accent ONLY.

600

dozen

Fluorescent Yellow,
#25025

62066620

3.84

2304.00

5.42

3252.00

3.90

0.00

4.04

2424.00

360

dozen

Fluorescent Green,
#25026

62066621

3.84

1382.40

5.42

1951.20

3.90

0.00

4.04

1454.40

lor
more

dozen

Fluorescent Pink, #25009

62066623

3.84

3.84

5.42

5.42

3.90

3.90

4.04

4.04

Sanford

2502x

Sanford

As Spec

Sanford

As Spec

Sanford As Spec

16

1,200

sets

Highlighter Marker Set
— Large size, 6-color set:
fl.yellow, fl.pink,
fl.orange, fl.green, yellow
& turquoise, Sanford
Sharpie #25076 ONLY

62066628

2.09

2508.00

2.83

3396.00

2.00

2400.00

2.14

2568.00

Sanford

25076

Sanford

25076

Sanford

25076

Sanford 25076

17

3,400

sets

Index, Ring Binder -
Insertable dividers,

8.5"x11", premium buff
stock, reinforced binding
edge, 5 clear tabs, Wilson-
Jones #W54125 or equal.

61566702

0.22

748.00

0.31

1054.00

0.27

918.00

0.21

714.00

Kleerfax

05110

SchoolSmart

81934

KLF

11005

Premier 5C

18

500

sets

Markers - Fiber tip,
permanent ink, 5-pack/4-
color set: (black/2, blue,

green, red), Sanford
Charnia #2NAE2 nr aniial

62066624

2.78

1390.00

0.00

No Bid

2.50

1250.00

2.75

1375.00

Sanford

30653

Sanford

30653

Sanford 30653

(16-067pr006spr.xls)

Page 6

BID #16-615-067

12/07/15



BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

19

1,200

sets

Markers - Whiteboard,
dry erase, 8 color set,
bullet tip, Sanford Expo
#88078 or equal.

62066622

2.32

2784.00

0.00 No Bid

3.77

4524.00

0.00 No Bid

Liquimrk 24800

Dixon

92180

20

1,200

doz.

Marker - Whiteboard, dry
erase, Black, bullet tip,
Sanford #88001 or equal

62066626

3.30

3960.00

3.94 4728.00

4.67

5604.00

7.20 8640.00

Liquimrk 24001

Perfection 8808

Liqui-Mk

24001

Expo 88001

21

lor
more

pkg.

Name Badges--Self-adh.,
"Hello, My Name Is", 2-
5/16"x 3-3/8", Red, 100/
pkg., Leonard #93535 or
equal

61566616

0.82

0.82

0.00 No Bid

3.65

3.65

0.00 No Bid

Leonard 93535

Leonard

93535

22

400

ctn.

Paper Clips, #1 - Smooth
finish, 100/box, 10

bxs./ctn., Leonard #201E
or equal.

61566067

1.28

512.00

0.00 No Bid

2.50

1000.00

0.00 No Bid

Officemate 99911

Leonard

201E

23

400

ctn.

Paper Clips, Jumbo -
Smooth finish, 100/box,

10 bxs./ctn., Leonard
#301E or equal.

61566068

3.75

1500.00

0.00 No Bid

6.50

2600.00

0.00 No Bid

Officemate 99914

Leonard

3012E

24

12

each

Paper Cutter - 15",
comm. grade square

guillotine style, w/ guard,
wood only, X-Acto

LALPLAT mv mmeiinld

78529794

93.97

1127.64

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Acco 1142A

25

360

each

Paper Punch - 3 hole, X-
Acto #1549 or equal.

61530078

6.18

2224.80

2.75 990.00

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Acco 7074134

Imperial 1675-3
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School S

pecialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

19

1,200

sets

Markers - Whiteboard,
dry erase, 8 color set,
bullet tip, Sanford Expo
#88078 or equal.

62066622

2.20

2640.00

6.58

7896.00

2.50

3000.00

2.17

2604.00

LiquiMrk

24800

Sanford

88074

Liqui-Mark**

24800

LiquiMrk

24800

20

1,200

doz.

Marker - Whiteboard, dry
erase, Black, bullet tip,
Sanford #88001 or equal

62066626

3732.00

9.36

11232.00

3.98

4776.00

3.08

3696.00

LiquiMark

24001

Sanford

88001

Liqui-Mark**

24001

LiquiMark

24001

21

lor
more

pkg.

Name Badges--Self-adh.,
"Hello, My Name Is", 2-
5/16"x 3-3/8", Red, 100/
pkg., Leonard #93535 or
equal

61566616

0.75

0.75

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.657

0.657

Leonard

93535

ShurStick

05140

22

400

ctn.

Paper Clips, #1 - Smooth
finish, 100/box, 10

bxs./ctn., Leonard #201E
or equal.

61566067

1.29

516.00

1.60

640.00

0.00

No Bid

1.27

508.00

Leonard

201E

SchoolSmart

84472.00

Officemate

PO.1

23

400

ctn.

Paper Clips, Jumbo -
Smooth finish, 100/box,

10 bxs./ctn., Leonard
#301E or equal.

61566068

3.60

1440.00

4.80

1920.00

0.00

No Bid

3.73

1492.00

Leonard

301E

SchoolSmart

84475

Officemate

PO.G

24

12

each

Paper Cutter - 15",
comm. grade square

guillotine style, w/ guard,
wood only, X-Acto

LALPLAT mv mmeiinld

78529794

50.09

601.08

65.14

781.68

50.00

600.00

56.40

676.80

X-Acto

26615

X-Acto

26615

X-Acto

26615

X-Acto

26615

25

360

each

Paper Punch - 3 hole, X-
Acto #1549 or equal.

61530078

3.39

1220.40

2.96

1065.60

0.00

No Bid

2.64

950.40

Leonard

033

SchoolSmart

25983

Standard
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or

Out-of-

State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit

Price Total

Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

26

360

each

Paper Punch - Single
1/4" hole, w/comfort grip

& receptacle, X-Acto
#1521 or equal

61530080

0.00

No Bid

0.40 144.00

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Imperial 16760

27

220

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Black,
soft grip, fine point, cap
w/ pocket clip, 12/box,
Papermate #88082 or
equal.

62066604

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

28

50

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Blue,
soft grip, fine point, cap
w/ pocket clip, 12/box,
Papermate #88083 or
equal.

62066619

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

29

120

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Red,
soft grip, fine point, cap
w/ pocket clip, 12/ box,
PaperMate 3371131 or

62066606

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

30

600

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Black,
soft grip, medium point,
cap w/ pocket clip,
12/box, Papermate

62066603

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

31

280

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Blue,
soft grip, medium point,
cap w/pocket clip, 12/box,
Papermate #88080 or
equal.

62066618

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

32

50

doz.

Pen, Ball Point
Retractable - Black, fine
point, Papermate #63801
or equal.

62066640

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School Specialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-

State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

26

360

each

Paper Punch - Single
1/4" hole, w/comfort grip

& receptacle, X-Acto
#1521 or equal

61530080

0.38

136.80

0.60

216.00

0.00

No Bid

0.374

134.64

Pyramid

1111160

SchoolSmart

86332

Standard

G-1

27

220

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Black,
soft grip, fine point, cap
w/ pocket clip, 12/box,
Papermate #88082 or
equal.

62066604

0.79

173.80

8.71

1916.20

0.00

No Bid

0.574

126.28

Papermate

3381131

Papermate

9680131

Stickwriter

5700

28

50

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Blue,
soft grip, fine point, cap
w/ pocket clip, 12/box,
Papermate #88083 or
equal.

62066619

0.79

39.50

8.71

435.50

0.00

No Bid

0.574

28.70

Papermate

336131

Papermate

9660131

Stickwriter

5700

29

120

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Red,
soft grip, fine point, cap
w/ pocket clip, 12/ box,
PaperMate 3371131 or

62066606

0.79

94.80

8.71

1045.20

0.00

No Bid

0.574

68.88

Papermate

3371131

Papermate

9670131

Stickwriter

5700

30

600

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Black,
soft grip, medium point,
cap w/ pocket clip,
12/box, Papermate

62066603

0.79

474.00

1.20

720.00

0.00

No Bid

0.574

344.40

Papermate

3331131

SchoolSmart

1400756

Stickwriter

5700

31

280

boxes

Pen, Ball Point - Blue,
soft grip, medium point,
cap w/pocket clip, 12/box,
Papermate #88080 or
equal.

62066618

0.79

221.20

1.20

336.00

0.00

No Bid

0.574

160.72

Papermate

3311131

SchoolSmart

1400758

Stickwriter

5700

32

50

doz.

Pen, Ball Point
Retractable - Black, fine
point, Papermate #63801
or equal.

62066640

4.92

246.00

0.00

No Bid

4.48

224.00

5.38

269.00

Papermate

63801

Papermate

63801

Papermate

63801

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID

TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit

Price Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

33

120

doz. |Pen, Ball Point

#66301 or equal.

Retractable - Black,
medium point, Papermate

62066641

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

34

120

doz.

#14259 or equal.

Pencil, Colored - Red,
wi/eraser, hexagon, bonded
lead, Dixon Ticonderoga

62029975

0.95 114.00

0.00 No Bid

2.79

334.80

0.00 No Bid

Liquimrk 72

doz.

63127

Dixon

14259

35

7,500

Pencil, Grade #2 -
Bonded lead, black

doz.

yellow finish, Dixon

graphite, w/latex-free
eraser, cedar encased,

62029979

0.57 4275.00

0.00 No Bid

0.93

6975.00

0.00 No Bid

Liquimrk 120

doz.

66421

Dixon

12872

36

200

each |Pencil Sharpener -

#1031 ONLY

Multiple hole, deluxe wall-
mount, Boston KS/X-Acto

61530076

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

12.95

2590.00

0.00 No Bid

Boston

KS1031

37

1,200

pkg.

#860 or equal.

Putty Adhesive - 2 oz.,
color: White, 3M Scotch

61566617

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

1.33

1596.00

0.00 No Bid

UHU Tac

99683

38

Report Covers - Letter
size, twin pocket with (3)
prong fasteners, reinforced
edges, leatherette-grained
stock. 25/box. Oxford or

600

boxes |Red, #57711

61566002

551 3306.00

571 3426.00

6.30

3780.00

0.00 No Bid

600

boxes |Blue, #57701

61566003

5.51 3306.00

5.71 3426.00

6.30

3780.00

0.00 No Bid

240

boxes |Green, #57703

61566001

5.51 1322.40

571 1370.40

6.60

1584.00

0.00 No Bid

Oxford

5077x

Imperial 57711,

57702,

File-EZ

*%

80128xx

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School Specialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-

TITY | UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

33

120{ doz.

Pen, Ball Point
Retractable - Black,
medium point, Papermate
#66301 or equal.

62066641

4.92

590.40

1.47

176.40

4.48

537.60

5.38

645.60

Papermate

63301

SchoolSmart

1400761

Papermate

63101

Papermate 63301

34

120( doz.

Pencil, Colored - Red,
wi/eraser, hexagon, bonded
lead, Dixon Ticonderoga
#14259 or equal.

62029975

0.87

104.40

3.70

444.00

0.93

111.60

0.868

104.16

LiquiMark

63127

Dixon

14259

Liqui-Mark**

63127

PerfectPt. 510T

35

7,500| doz.

Pencil, Grade #2 -
Bonded lead, black
graphite, w/latex-free
eraser, cedar encased,
yellow finish, Dixon

62029979

.66 49

4950.00
3075.00

1.07

8025.00

0.56

4200.00

0.458

3435.00

Dixon
Musgrave

12872, 1101
Yellow
Special

Dixon

12872

Liqui-Mark**

66421

224-2
PerfectPt.

36

200| each

Pencil Sharpener -
Multiple hole, deluxe wall-
mount, Boston KS/X-Acto
#1031 ONLY

61530076

5.49

1098.00

7.26

1452.00

5.57

1114.00

5.49

1098.00

Boston

KS1031

Boston

KS1031

X-Acto

KS1031

Boston KS1031

37

1,200|pkg.

Putty Adhesive - 2 oz.,
color: White, 3M Scotch
#860 or equal.

61566617

0.97

1164.00

1.15

1380.00

0.00

No Bid

0.424

508.80

Scotch

860

Elmers

1031

PowerTak SA-3011B

38

Report Covers - Letter
size, twin pocket with (3)
prong fasteners, reinforced
edges, leatherette-grained
stock. 25/box. Oxford or

600| boxes

Red, #57711

61566002

5.48

3288.00

12.60

7560.00

0.00

No Bid

4.16

2496.00

600| boxes

Blue, #57701

61566003

5.48

3288.00

12.60

7560.00

0.00

No Bid

4.16

2496.00

240| boxes

Green, #57703

61566001

5.48

1315.20

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

4.16

998.40

Esselte
Oxford

577xx

Tops

577xx

Standard 128xx

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational

Products

National Art & School

Supplies

In-State or Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

39

360

boxes

Rubber Bands - Size
#19, premium pale crepe
gold rubber, 3-1/2" x
1/16", 1 Ib. box, Alliance
#20195 or equal.

61566010

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

40

120

each

Ruler, Meter Stick -
Hardwood, clear lacquer
finish, brass end, Acme
Westcott #10431 or equal.

61530050

1.29

154.80

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Acme

10431

41

12

boxes

Ruler - 12"/30cm long,
1/16-inch scale, 36/box,
hard- wood, clear lacquer
finish, single brass edge,
Acme Westcott #10377 or
equal.

61566602

10.58

126.96

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Acme

10377

42

10

boxes

Ruler - 18" long, 1/16"
scale, 12/bx, hardwood,
clear lacquer finish, single
brass edge, Acme
Westcott #05018 or equal.

61566600

7.78

77.80

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Acme

05018

43

1,800

each

Scissors, Teachers - 5"
hardened stainless steel
blades, straight, molded
handles, 8-1/4" overall,
w/plastic cover, Fiskars
#01-004249) or equal.

61566520

1.47

2646.00

.52
1.06

936.00
1908.00

2.88 5184.00

2.72 4896.00

Fiskars
Acme

01-004249]
46218

Imperial

1785-08B
178418B

Fiskar 01-0042495

Fiskars 01-0042495

44

300

pkg.

Self-Stick Notes - 3" x 5",
canary yellow, 100 sheets/
pad, 12 pads/pkg., 3M
#6559-YW or equal.

61566632

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

2.97 891.00

3M 6559

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School S

pecialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard

Stationery

Supply

In-State or

Out-of-

State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State -

IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

39

360

boxes

Rubber Bands - Size
#19, premium pale crepe
gold rubber, 3-1/2" x
1/16", 1 Ib. box, Alliance
#20195 or equal.

61566010

2.27

817.20

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

1.98

712.80

Alliance

#19

General

#19

40

120

each

Ruler, Meter Stick -
Hardwood, clear lacquer
finish, brass end, Acme
Westcott #10431 or equal.

61530050

1.09

130.80

0.91

109.20

0.00

No Bid

1.06

127.20

Acme

10431

SchoolSmart

81902.00

Standard

97R

41

12

boxes

Ruler - 12"/30cm long,
1/16-inch scale, 36/box,
hard- wood, clear lacquer
finish, single brass edge,
Acme Westcott #10377 or
equal.

61566602

5.07

60.84

9.00

108.00

0.00

No Bid

4.13

49.56

Acme

10702

Acme

10377.00

Standard

K5-611

42

10

boxes

Ruler - 18" long, 1/16"
scale, 12/bx, hardwood,
clear lacquer finish, single
brass edge, Acme
Westcott #05018 or equal.

61566600

6.49

64.90

4.08

40.80

0.00

No Bid

5.34

53.40

Acme

5018

SchoolSmart

81892.00

Standard

931-18

43

1,800

each

Scissors, Teachers - 5"
hardened stainless steel
blades, straight, molded
handles, 8-1/4" overall,
w/plastic cover, Fiskars
#01-004249) or equal.

61566520

2.57
44

4626.00
792.00

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.388

698.40

Fiskars
Acme

004249
40618

Edge

E2000

44

300

pkg.

Self-Stick Notes - 3" x 5",
canary yellow, 100 sheets/
pad, 12 pads/pkg., 3M
#6559-YW or equal.

61566632

2.96
3.51

888.00
1053.00

3.35

1005.00

3.40

1020.00

2.90

870.00

Leonard
3M

33305
6559

SchoolSmart

84879

3M

6559

Beautone

11050

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

45

1,000

pkg.

Self-Stick Notes - 3" x 3",
canary yellow, 100 shts/
pad, 12 pads/ pkg., 3M
#6549 or equal.

61566614

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

2.64 2640.00

3M 6549

46

600

pkg.

Self-Stick Notes - 1-
1/2" x 2", canary yellow,
100 sheets/pad, 12
pads/pkg., 3M #6539 or
equal.

61566615

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.95 570.00

3M 6539

47

2,400

boxes

Sheet Protectors - Top
loading, clear, for 8-
1/2”x11” sheets, standard
wt., 50/box, Wilson-Jones
#W21420 or equal.

61566630

2.79

6552.00

141

3384.00

4.35 10440.00

0.00 No Bid

Wilson Jones

21420.00

Imperial

17869TL

Samsill 42293.00

48

Stamp Pad - Foam, size
#1 ,Leonard or eq.

150

each

Black, #92220

61566576

0.75

112.50

0.00

No Bid

1.25 187.50

0.00 No Bid

150

each

Red, #92230

61566577

0.75

112.50

0.00

No Bid

1.25 187.50

0.00 No Bid

Leonard

92220
92230

Leonard 92220/92230

49

Stamp Pad Ink - 2 oz.,
applicator top, Azor

#587NE or equal

20

each

Black

61566578

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

20

each

Red

61566579

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

50

800

each

Staple Remover - Steel
prongs with plastic grips,
Standard Stationery
#32002 or equal.

61566571

0.31

248.00

0.177

141.60

0.00 No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Leonard 50

Imperial

18360

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION CLASSROOMY/OFFICE SUPPLIES
Pyramid School Smith Office & Computer | Standard Stationery
Products School Specialty Sply. Supply
In-State or Out-of-State? Out-of-State -
In-State Wi In-State Out-of-State - IL
If Out, percentage of preference 2%
QUAN- TERMS
TITY JUNIT DESCRIPTION ITEM# | UnitPrice | Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
45| 1,000 pkg. |Self-Stick Notes - 3" x 3",|61566614 2.47 2470.00 2.05 2050.00 2.45 2450.00 1.95 1950.00
canary yellow, 100 shts/ 1.96 1960.00
pad, 12 pads/ pkg., 3M
#6549 or equal.
3M 6549 SchoolSmart 84876 3M 6549 Beautone 11030
Leonard 33100
46 600| pkg. |[Self-Stick Notes- 1- |61566615 1.13 678.00 1.03 618.00 1.13 678.00 0.93 556.80
1/2" x 2", canary yellow, .94 564.00
100 sheets/pad, 12
pads/pkg., 3M #6539 or
equal.
3M 6539 SchoolSmart {84874 3M 6539 Beautone 11110
Leonard 33152
47| 2,400| boxes |Sheet Protectors - Top |61566630 1.43 3432.00 3.52 8448.00 0.00 No Bid 1.42 3408.00
loading, clear, for 8-
1/2”x11” sheets, standard
wt., 50/box, Wilson-Jones
#W21420 or equal.
Pyramid 1111723 SchoolSmart 67506 Premier 42293
48 Stamp Pad - Foam, size
#1 ,Leonard or eq.
150| each |Black, #92220 61566576 0.59 88.50 0.31 46.50 0.00 No Bid 0.524 78.60
150| each |Red, #92230 61566577 0.59 88.50 0.31 46.50 0.00 No Bid 0.524 78.60
Azor #1xx SchoolSmart 84906/84909 Inkster 15Pxx
49 Stamp Pad Ink - 2 oz.,
applicator top, Azor
#587NE or equal
20| each |Black 61566578 0.77 15.40 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.78 15.60
20| each |Red 61566579 0.77 15.40 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.00 0.78 15.60
Azor 587xx Inkster 587
50 800| each |Staple Remover - Steel 61566571 0.20 160.00 0.24 192.00 0.00 No Bid 0.195 156.00
prongs with plastic grips,
Standard Stationery
#32002 or equal.
Pyramid 1111384 SchoolSmart 189 Standard 32002

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

AFP Industries

Canadian HIP Industries

DGS Educational
Products

National Art & School
Supplies

In-State or Out-of-State?

In-State

Out of State

In-State

In-State

If Out, percentage

of preference

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price | Total Price

51

1,200

each

Stapler - Desk type, steel
construction, must use full
strip of stan. staples,
Bostitch #B440 or equal.

61566570

3.02

3624

2.685 3222.00

3.16

3792.00

0.00 No Bid

Bostitch

B440

Imperial 66-029

Bostitch

B440

52

1,200

boxes

Staples, Standard -
Prem. chisel pt. only,

5M/box, 25 bx./ctn,
Bostitch #SBS191/4CP or
equal

61566575

0.46

552.00

0.404 484.80

0.65

780.00

0.00 No Bid

Bostitch

SBS1914CP

Imperial 18305

Bostitch

53

120

pkg.

Tabs - For hanging file
folders, clear, 2”7, 25/ pkg.,
Kleerfax #01-142 or

61566243

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

54

1,600

rolls

Tape, Clear - 1/2" x
1296", each roll sealed
individ, 3M Highland
#5910 or equal.

83266598

0.00

No Bid

0.262 419.20

0.35

560.00

0.00 No Bid

Imperial 18625-1/2

Leonard

49712

55

3,000

rolls

Tape, Invisible - 3/4” x
1296”, individ.sealed, 3M
Highland #6200 or equal.

83266597

0.00

No Bid

0.373 1119.00

0.60

1800.00

0.67 2010.00

Imperial 18801-3/4

Leonard

49534

3M 6200

56

1,200

rolls

Tape, Sealing - Clear, 2”
x 110 yds., 3M #3690L or
equal.

83229701

1.29

1548.00

0.00 No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Shurtech

240054

57

750

each

Tape Dispenser - For
tape up to 3/4" wide, desk

type, School Specialty

61566140

0.00

No Bid

0.794 595.50

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

Imperial 1892BK

58

80

each

Telephone Message
Book - Carbonless, dup.,

400 sets/bk,4/pg., book
size 11" x 5-1/2", Tops
#4003 or equal.

39698398

0.00

No Bid

0.00 No Bid

10.00

800.00

0.00 No Bid

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School
Products

School Specialty

Smith Office & Computer
Sply.

Standard Stationery
Supply

In-State or

Out-of-State?

In-State

Out-of-State -
Wi

In-State

Out-of-State - IL

If Out, percentage

of preference

2%

QUAN-
TITY

UNIT

DESCRIPTION

TERMS
ITEM#

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

Unit Price

Total Price

51

1,200

each

Stapler - Desk type, steel
construction, must use full
strip of stan. staples,
Bostitch #B440 or equal.

61566570

2.89

3468.00

5.46

6552.00

2.65

3180.00

1.50
2.86

1800.00
3432.00

Bostitch

B440

Bostitch

B440

Bostitch

B440

Standard
Bostitch

220
B440

52

1,200

boxes

Staples, Standard -
Prem. chisel pt. only,

5M/box, 25 bx./ctn,
Bostitch #SBS191/4CP or
equal

61566575

0.42

504.00

0.50

600.00

0.47

564.00

0.398

477.60

Leonard

84500

SchoolSmart

61059

Bostitch

SBS1914CP

Standard

5TBC

53

120

pkg.

Tabs - For hanging file
folders, clear, 2”7, 25/ pkg.,
Kleerfax #01-142 or

61566243

0.75

90.00

1.32

158.40

0.00

No Bid

0.88

105.60

Kleerfax

01421

Pendaflex

94200

Kleerfax

01421

54

1,600

rolls

Tape, Clear - 1/2" x
1296", each roll sealed
individ, 3M Highland
#5910 or equal.

83266598

.367
.26

587.20
416.00

0.46

736.00

0.295

No Bid

0.248

396.80

3M
Leonard

5910
49712

3M

5910

Tapemte

5000

55

3,000

rolls

Tape, Invisible - 3/4” x
1296”, individ.sealed, 3M
Highland #6200 or equal.

83266597

.666
41

1998.00
1230.00

0.00

No Bid

0.00

No Bid

0.33

990.00

3M
Leonard

6200
49534

Tapemte

6100

56

1,200

rolls

Tape, Sealing - Clear, 2”
x 110 yds., 3M #3690L or
equal.

83229701

1.14

1368.00

0.00

No Bid

1380.00

.85
1.08

1020.00
1296.00

3M

3690

3M

3690L

ClearStik
3M

PP-2110

3690L

57

750

each

Tape Dispenser - For
tape up to 3/4" wide, desk
type, School Specialty

61566140

0.79

592.50

0.80

600.00

0.00

No Bid

0.784

588.00

Pyramid

1111582

SchoolSmart

40617

Standard

C-38

58

80

each

Telephone Message
Book - Carbonless, dup.,

400 sets/bk,4/pg., book
size 11" x 5-1/2", Tops
#4003 or equal.

39698398

2.25

180.00

3.59

287.20

2.20

176.00

2.54

203.20

(16-067pr006spr.xls)
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

(16-067pr006spr.xls)

DGS Educational National Art & School
AFP Industries Canadian HIP Industries Products Supplies
In-State or Out-of-State?
In-State Out of State In-State In-State
If Out, percentage of preference
QUAN- TERMS
TITY | UNIT DESCRIPTION ITEM# Unit Price Total Price | UnitPrice | Total Price | UnitPrice | Total Price | Unit Price | Total Price
Tops 4003
59 120| boxes |Thumb Tacks - #2 solid |61566601 0.27 32.40 0.00 No Bid 0.54 64.80 0.00 No Bid

hd., nickel plated, 3/8"
dia., 100/box, Leonard
#912 or equal.

Leonard 912 Leonard 912.00

60 60| each |Yardstick, 36" - 1/8" 61530048 1.01 60.60 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid

scale, hardwood, clear
lacquer finish, Acme
#10420 or equal

Acme 10420

**minimum order - 260
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BID TABULATION

CLASSROOM/OFFICE SUPPLIES

Pyramid School Smith Office & Computer | Standard Stationery
Products School Specialty Sply. Supply
In-State or Out-of-State? Out-of-State -
In-State Wi In-State Out-of-State - IL
If Out, percentage of preference 2%
QUAN- TERMS
TITY JUNIT DESCRIPTION ITEM# | UnitPrice | Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price | UnitPrice | Total Price
Tops 4003 Tops 4003 Tops 4003 Tops 4003
59 120| boxes |Thumb Tacks - #2 solid |61566601 0.27 32.40 0.52 62.40 0.00 0.00 0.138 16.56
hd., nickel plated, 3/8"
dia., 100/box, Leonard
#912 or equal.
Leonard 912 OfficeMate 912 Standard TT-2
60 60| each |Yardstick, 36" - 1/8" 61530048 0.79 47.40 0.68 40.80 0.00 0.00 0.784 47.04
scale, hardwood, clear
lacquer finish, Acme
#10420 or equal
Acme 10420 SchoolSmart 81899 Acme 10420
**full case quantity:
$1,300.00 |
Page 20
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