
SCHOOL BOARD OF PINELLAS COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BID #14-192-043

Bid Title:  Floor Care Products

Date & Time Due:  September 30, 2013 @ 3 p.m.

American Chemical & 

Building Maintenance 

Supply, Inc.

Buckeye Cleaning 

Center of Tampa
Gem Supply Company

In-State In-State In-State

N/A N/A N/A

Item # Category #1 - Description

1
Floor Finish, General - Non-yellowing, low odor floor finish.  5 gallon plastic pails.  

NCL - Invincible #0595-21 Only

Minimum Order Quantity 36 No Bid No Bid

Unit Price (5 Gallon Container) $55.90 No Bid No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Container) 288 288 288

Extended Total (5 Gallon Container) $16,099.20 No Bid No Bid

2
Floor Finish, General - Non-yellowing, low odor floor finish.  5 gallon plastic pails.  

NCL - 24/7 Non Buffing #0593-21 Only

Minimum Order Quantity 36 No Bid No Bid

Unit Price (5 Gallon Container) $61.30 No Bid No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Container) 225 225 225

Extended Total (5 Gallon Container) $13,792.50 No Bid No Bid

3
Cleaner, Floor, Neutral - Neutral floor cleaner that will not harm floor finishes.  NCL - 

Image #0927-21 Only

Minimum Order Quantity 36 No Bid No Bid

Unit Price (5 Gallon Container) $23.00 No Bid No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Container) 200 200 200

Extended Total (5 Gallon Container) $4,600.00 No Bid No Bid

4 Finish Remover - NCL - Bare Bones #1058-21 Only

Minimum Order Quantity 36 No Bid No Bid

Unit Price (5 Gallon Container) $47.75 No Bid No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Container) 200 200 200

Extended Total (5 Gallon Container) $9,550.00 No Bid No Bid

Category #1 Grand Total: $44,041.70 No Bid No Bid

In-State or Out-of-State Vendor?

If Out-of-State, % of Preference Given:
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SCHOOL BOARD OF PINELLAS COUNTY, FLORIDA

Bid Tabulation

BID #14-192-043

Bid Title:  Floor Care Products

Date & Time Due:  September 30, 2013 @ 3 p.m.

American Chemical & 

Building Maintenance 

Supply, Inc.

Buckeye Cleaning 

Center of Tampa
Gem Supply Company

Item # Category #2 - Description

1
Floor Finish, Special, Buckeye - Castleguard High Speed 25% Solids 

#B.CASTAP Only

Minimum Order Quantity No Bid 1 No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Containers) 600 600 600

Unit Price No Bid $87.89 No Bid

Extended Total No Bid $52,734.00 No Bid

2 Floor Finish, Special, Buckeye - Liquid-Max Non Buffing #B.LIQMAXAP Only

Minimum Order Quantity No Bid 1 No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Containers) 500 500 500

Unit Price No Bid $79.29 No Bid

Extended Total No Bid $39,645.00 No Bid

3 Finish Remover, Special, Buckeye RipSaw #B.RIPSAP Only

Minimum Order Quantity No Bid 1 No Bid

Estimated Annual Usage (5 Gallon Containers) 300 300 300

Unit Price No Bid $63.45 No Bid

Extended Total No Bid $19,035.00 No Bid

Category #2 Grand Total: No Bid $111,414.00 No Bid

Item # Category #3 - Description

1
Floor Finish, Remover - 12 quarts/case, Zagers brand Z-310 Max, Triple S Red Zone 

#48110 Only

Class, Brand & Product Number Bid No Bid No Bid Zagers Brand #Z-310-Max

Minimum Order Quantity No Bid No Bid 1 Case

Unit Price Per Case No Bid No Bid 128.82

Estimated Annual Usage 30 30 30

Extended Total No Bid No Bid $3,864.60
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